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“Are things going to get better?  
 

What a man sows that shall he also reap.” 
 
 
 

A Nations Sin has physical, temporary,  
and spiritual, eternal, consequences. 

 
          Every sin by every person will be judged. Some will be judged 
in the righteousness of Jesus Christ unto eternal life. Many will die in 
their sins unto eternal damnation? The Lord alludes to this, in, 
Galatians 6:7-8: 
 
Galatians 6:7-8 Be not deceived; God is not mocked: for whatsoever 
a man soweth, that shall he also reap.  8 For he that soweth to his 
flesh shall of the flesh reap corruption; but he that soweth to the 
Spirit shall of the Spirit reap life everlasting. 
 
          Sowing to the flesh does not mean eating of our earthly food, or 
the enjoying the many earthly blessings God creates for us; except if 
we worship these things as our ultimate source of comfort in place of 
the Spirit of God who is the believers Comfort (John 14:26).   
 
          Sowing to the Spirit happens when the Lord plants His living 
word in our heart and soul which He has chosen as good ground in 
Christ. We then daily meditate upon His Holy Word the Bible, which 
is the sword of the Spirit, with an attitude of obedience unto His 
righteousness, as we continually examine ourselves.  
 
Ephesians 6:17 And take the helmet of salvation, and the sword of 
the Spirit, which is the word of God: 
 
Hebrews 4:12 For the word of God is quick, and powerful, and 
sharper than any twoedged sword, piercing even to the dividing 
asunder of soul and spirit, and of the joints and marrow, and is a 
discerner of the thoughts and intents of the heart. 
 
          While, Galatians 6:7-8, is not teaching that man cannot enjoy 
the earthly things God has created for His physical well being, 
however, if we are worshipping these earthly blessings we are sowing 
to the flesh with a spiritual attitude that is contrary to the Wisdom of 
God. The Spirit of Christ purposely became liken unto sinful flesh to 
give us an example of how we are to walk physically and spiritually 
while on the sin cursed earth. 
 
1 Peter 2:20-25  For what glory is it, if, when ye be buffeted for your 
faults, ye shall take it patiently? but if, when ye do well, and suffer 
for it, ye take it patiently, this is acceptable with God.  21 For even 
hereunto were ye called: because Christ also suffered for us, leaving 
us an example, that ye should follow his steps:   
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22 Who did no sin, neither was guile found in his mouth:  23 Who, 
when he was reviled, reviled not again; when he suffered, he 
threatened not; but committed himself to him that judgeth 
righteously:  24 Who his own self bare our sins in his own body on 
the tree, that we, being dead to sins, should live unto righteousness: 
by whose stripes ye were healed.  25 For ye were as sheep going 
astray; but are now returned unto the Shepherd and Bishop of your 
souls.  
 
          Some may say, “yes, that’s of the spiritual work we do;  the 
flesh profits nothing!” While this is true, yet, this response often 
reveals an attitude where the words and deeds of man is totally 
unimportant, but God’s work only; as if the work His elect do is not 
ordained by the Spirit of Christ, so that they are ‘one flesh’, (Ephesians 
5:31-32)! Too often many will not lift their little finger to practice 
what they so eloquently preach.  
 
James 1:22 But be ye doers of the word, and not hearers only, 
deceiving your own selves. 
 
Jas 2:26 For as the body without the spirit is dead, so faith without 
works is dead also. 
 
          The idea that the elects works are meaningless is not biblical. 
This will have nothing to do with how the elect become saved. We 
can do NOTHING to acquire our own salvation! God alone must do 
the work of both justification and sanctification. However, if the 
elects works ordained of the Lord, (Ephesians 2:10), are  meaningless 
how does God justify judging Adam and Eve in the Garden of Eden 
after eating from the tree of the knowledge of good and evil? A 
physical work they performed which they were not commanded to do, 
but were commanded not to do in their tilling of the Garden? Second, 
how does God justify His own words, in, Revelation 14:13, regarding 
His chosen elect:  
 
Revelation 14:13 ¶ And I heard a voice from heaven saying unto me, 
Write, Blessed are the dead which die in the Lord from henceforth: 
Yea, saith the Spirit, that they may rest from their labours; and their 
works do follow them. 
 
          God’s word is very clear as we meditate upon it from the Holy 
Bible, that what we do in our earthly tabernacles on this sin cursed 
earth has everything to do with who we ultimately are in our soul and 
spirit. Therefore, Christ set the example how His elect are to speak 
and to walk?  
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          In, John 3:11-12, we can see, in Nichodemus’ words, how 
mankind, [the world], think and walk in themselves, according to 
their own understanding:  
 
John 3:4, 11-12 Nicodemus saith unto him, How can a man be born 
when he is old? can he enter the second time into his mother's 
womb, and be born?  
 
          Part of Jesus’ answer to Nichodemus is according to God’s 
understanding of mankind’s inability in himself to see the things of 
the Spirit of God:  
 
Verily, verily, I say unto thee, We speak that we do know, and testify 
that we have seen; and ye receive not our witness. 12 If I have told 
you earthly things, and ye believe not, how shall ye believe, if I tell 
you of heavenly things? 
 
          Did God not come in the flesh (Isaiah 9:6)? Did not Jesus show 
how He was that Son of God (Mark 14:48-49)? When people fail to see 
or reject God’s word God shows the physical application that’s 
included in their rejection? In, John 6:66, as well as many other places 
in scripture, the Lord, physically and spiritually experienced this 
rejection personally:  
 
John 6:64-66  But there are some of you that believe not. For Jesus 
knew from the beginning who they were that believed not, and who 
should betray him.  65 And he said, Therefore said I unto you, that 
no man can come unto me, except it were given unto him of my 
Father.  66 From that time many of his disciples went back, and 
walked no more with him. 
 
           Those who walked no more with Jesus, who rejected Him, 
rejected Him spiritually and physically; so that Jesus, who was in the 
likeness of sinful flesh was Spiritually moved to ask: 
 
John 6:67 Then said Jesus unto the twelve, Will ye also go away?  
 
          As Jesus is speaking these words was He not God, in the 
likeness of sinful flesh, humbly, purposely, submitting Himself to 
experience the same physical and spiritual suffering his elect were 
experiencing, (Romans 8:3-4), yet, while without sin! Those who 
physically walked away from Christ were revealing what had always 
been the condition of their spirit and soul. Minds that were not of 
Christ!  
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          In time our integrated being of body, soul, and spirit, eventually 
reveals the condition of its spirit and soul, [mind]! It is in this context 
Jesus spoke to the Pharisee Nichodemus:  
 
John 3:12 If I have told you earthly things, and ye believe not, how 
shall ye believe, if I tell you of heavenly things? 

 
          Nichodemus had to have known man cannot physically go into 
his mothers womb a second time! How does he who is a master, 
[Pharisee], in the Old Testament law, justify not understanding what 
Jesus is saying to Him from the scripture?  
 
          While it should be common sense that a man cannot physically 
return to his mothers womb, it is not commons sense that man must 
be born again, until God might open the eyes that we perceive how 
we must be born from above (1 John 3:9).   
 
          But what does all of this have to do with whether things are 
going to get better? How were they for Jesus who should be our 
ultimate example? Is this life not the way the world has always been 
and continues to be until its destruction? Hasn’t God already shown 
from His word, [the Old Testament], that when enough people are 
sowing sin to the flesh this accumulates a corruption that is 
inescapable and incurable; except God Himself steps in to stop His 
plague of judgment. But God will not over-rule the law of sowing and 
reaping; nor will He over-rule His preordained plan for this world’s 
end! No different than Adam and Eve in the Garden of Eden, what we 
sow in this earth is what we shall also reap, physically, and, 
spiritually, except we be born again. But being born again we desire 
more and more to sow to the Spirit not the flesh! Clearly, today, in the 
societies of our world, from every nation, this is not even remotely 
what is happening; but a total lack of the fear of God!   

 
The Devil and Satan 
have been let loosed: 

 
          The corporate world would certainly change this present reality 
if it could by casting off the bands of God’s elect preaching of the true 
gospel. And this is what we’re seeing today as the world is made to 
submit to the Elite Globalists who’s objective is to save the planet by 
controlling how the populous use the earths materials. The new green 
world order. Then there’s the Social Anarchists protesters and rioters 
who seek to reset society to their own will through fear and anarchy. 
They cannot show a plan for their new world, only a plan to destroy 
the one God would be in control of and not man. In this context, they 
create Chaos in order to maintain chaos in order to destroy the law 
and order and fear of God. Where would that power come from?  
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As antichrist’s without law, much of the world now are desiring to 
redo the world according to a Godless social immoralism. It is total 
rejection of God’s revealed word manifested by His physical creation, 
and His Spiritual Word the Holy Bible (Romans 1:18-20).  
 
          Next are the Race Hustlers who relentlessly assault people 
who exhibit light completion in their skin calling them white. Though 
Almighty God has created one human race, all of whom have equally 
fallen souls from Grace, (Romans 3:23), this evil crowd assigns 
everyone to an identity group giving themselves the freedom to 
legally discriminate to take the freedom from those they hate. After 
assigning these groups they accuse them of widespread sins because 
of who each individual is in the group, [which they created], 
according to ethnicity, not because of what each individual in the 
group have actually done themselves. We can know this is of the 
devil and Satan when these crowds attack any unity, any good will, 
any remnant of love, compassion, and forgiveness. They attack its 
foundation, tarring down statutes. They attack marriage. They attack 
the family. They attack the idea of Fathers, and mothers. They attack 
sexual normality between a man and a woman. Now where would that 
power come from? It comes from the devil and Satan!   
 
          Today all of these groups clearly expose the rising of ‘Mystery 
Babylon The Great, The Mother of Harlots and Abominations of the 
Earth’, (Revelation 17:5), as they capitalize on COVID19 as their 
leverage to get a world wide reset for their master who is the devil 
and Satan who seeks global domination before his soon end comes 
(Revelation 12:12). But it is God’s Judgment! Satan is the hammer 
which God always has His Right Hand on! The only thing standing in 
the antichrist’s way is the true church, [God’s elect], in Jesus Christ, 
particularly as it is continually hinted of in the Declaration of 
Independence and U.S. Constitution – documents most American’s 
have paid no attention to since the age of technology – which the 
enemy sees. In, 1967, the separation of church and state was easily 
passed, though it was based on a lie! Spiritually, the country as a 
whole was paying no attention, but to its new single family homes 
with running water, electricity, Frigidaire, gas & electric stoves, 
dishwashers, TV, and privately owned vehicles. The frosting on the 
cake: the new liberated expression many would find in rock and roll 
music.    
 
          It is in this context the church, most of it becoming apostate, 
would be ostracized, marginalized, down graded, and discredited, in 
time, which has been taking place as the founding documents of 
freedom to worship have been slowly changed as the people slept.  
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          Too many Christian churches as they exist around the world, as 
well as those who profess allegiants to the Conservative party, are 
actually accommodating this effort to destroy their own nation 
through their gross apostasy to the true Christian faith in Jesus Christ. 
As they give the world no reason to fear the god of the bible which 
they misrepresent through their hypocritical words and chronic 
missing in action.   
 
          So does the world have any believable hope that shows how 
things can improve through the efforts of man? If we would carefully 
look at the necessary conditions for God to bless America, through 
the politicians, the policy makers, the media, the social leaders, the 
educators, [which began with the founders of 1776 who feared God]; 
today, however, the general population, including most of the 
Christian churches, and so called Conservatives, would only be 
offended by those necessary conditions. Conditions presently in the 
Declaration of Independence and the U.S. Constitution. So, the 
problem is, those who yell the loudest about their victimhood 
concerning these documents show themselves not to understand these 
documents as reflected in their own behavior. Today, other than the 
fact they propose to support conservative biblical world views, yet, in 
their behavior look and sound no different than the adversary! And so 
the antichrist who sees this sees a great opportunity to discredit and 
marginalize these documents to their destruction. So while it may be 
true, most professing Christians today will confess a desire for God to 
bless them according to the scriptures, yet, their expressed physical 
behavior is hardly in line with His Spiritual terms according to the 
scriptures. And therein lies the ultimate plague of our day.  
 
          “So are things going to get any better? The direct answer is, 
‘No’! It can’t for one clear reason. What people sow they must also 
reap. Old Testament Israel was finally destroyed and condemned 
forever:”  
 
Job 4:8 Even as I have seen, they that plow iniquity, and sow 
wickedness, reap the same.  
 
Matthew 21:19 And when he saw a fig tree in the way, he came to it, 
and found nothing thereon, but leaves only, and said unto it, Let no 
fruit grow on thee henceforward for ever. And presently the fig tree 
withered away. 
 
          In our day there is so many people sowing sin to the flesh so 
that the harvest of corruption is too great to be reversed by any efforts 
of depraved sinful mankind. Except for God’s salvation we are slaves 
to unrighteousness. And of ourselves we have no power to change this 
condition; except we become born again, born from above (1 John 
3:9). And praise God for that possibility!  
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          But why should God stop His present wrath when He’s clearly 
warned from His word how His kingdom does not include this sin 
cursed earth; but a New Heaven and a New Earth, (Isaiah 65:17)! He 
not also shown from all of scripture what this world would look like 
just before His second coming? Certainly these things cannot indicate 
another restoration! For God does not save nations! Even Nineveh 
was destroyed for unbelief some years after her earlier repentance! 
God does not save nations eternally, but His elect souls before the 
world began (Ephesians 1:4).   
 
          Those on both side of any isle who  seek to restore the world, 
environmentally, socially, economically, morally, sexually, 
politically, are, in affect, trying to manifest a crop different than the 
one that is being sown. It is impossible that such a harvest can bare 
good fruit where corruption is primarily what is being sown! God’s 
mercy and love never shows to exist where an outward physical and 
spiritual repentance doesn’t follow His announcement of pending 
judgment.  
 
          America and the world have had that announcement of 
judgment from the Holy Bible since the first King James English 
manuscript of the Hebrew and Greek Bible! Yet, today, there is not 
the slightest indication of repentance coming from any of the world’s 
nations, particularly America. Just look at the TV! Any of it! It is all 
corrupt and the American people with it. The world as a whole acts as 
if it has never heard of the gospel it once feared and sought after. 
Therefore, just as in the Garden of Eden following Adam and Eve’s 
sin, God is not obligated to reinstate a warning and its end which He 
has already given if willingly ignored! A little sarcasm here to further 
the point:  
 
“Oh, OK Eve. So the devil beguiled you. OK, let’s get it clear next 
time then. And don’t do it again. Your not to eat of the tree of the 
knowledge of good and evil.”   
 
          Regarding this ludicrous statement above, according to God’s 
Holy Word, the Lord who is perfectly Righteous, and True in 
Himself, who is eternally without sin, cannot condone nor abide in sin 
that He did not commit, but had lovingly warned against. Another 
way of saying the same thing: for the above statement, [of sarcasm], 
to be actually coming from God makes God out to be a liar! For God 
to now change His mind regarding His first warning to Adam and Eve 
must make God a sinner who’s word is not believable, making the 
faith of Christ of none affect. This cannot be; but it is what the devil 
and Satan would have the world to believe, so that the world will 
believe Satan as being the Christ – who is rightfully called the Anti-
Christ.   
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          Subsequently, a foundational truth must unfold. The present 
governing of power of sin shall indeed exhibit, [temporarily], a great 
physical and spiritual harvest. It is, Mystery Babylon the Great, the 
Mother of Harlots and Abominations of the Earth, as God has now 
again warned from His word for those who have ears to hear. This is 
what the scripture clearly shows. And it will have come from what we 
are presently experiencing; the rapid sowing of corruption, and the 
reaping of destruction and death of the truths and morals of a nation 
that had previously been blessed and warned by its creator.  
 
          It is the death of a previously blessed nation who’s population 
has all but ceased to grow beyond it’s annual deaths. Why? Ask the 
millions and perhaps billions who have been aborted! Was not the 
God who had blessed this nation not watching? He has indeed been 
watching! So that the beast whom the Lord has now let loose can 
proclaim any nation to now enter its borders to take over its dying 
work force population, including the multitude of corrupt souls who, 
able, refuse to work. It is impossible for a nation that shows to be 
subdued by a world wide campaign of unrestrained sin, [as every 
nation is presently showing], to be reaping God’s blessing let alone 
recovery; except, His wrath.  
 
          While this has been an horrible experience for me, I would, 
nevertheless, come to terms with this reality as being God’s perfect 
will and good pleasure for our day, while in perpetual self-
examination I would be sure who I am in the Lord before His 
program of mercy and truth suddenly, surprisingly, concludes and 
time is no longer (Revelation 10:6). In, Joshua 24:15, the word of God 
shows how Joshua’s day was no different than our day, with the sole 
exception of a lesser amount of time remaining for the world:  
 
Joshua 24:15 ¶ And if it seem evil unto you to serve the LORD, 
choose you this day whom ye will serve; whether the gods which 
your fathers served that were on the other side of the flood, or the 
gods of the Amorites, in whose land ye dwell: but as for me and my 
house, we will serve the LORD. 
 
          The corrupt and apostate churches of our day now use such 
verses as, Joshua 24:15, to prove how mankind can choose for God’s 
salvation; when this verse is saying nothing of the sort. History is 
merely repeating itself, but this time, as it repeats itself, it is 
simultaneously concluding the unfolding of the time line of history of 
the gospel of the Lord Jesus Christ.  
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          Is our day really any better than Joshua’s day, than Jesus’ day? 
We would remember, how, in, Joshua 24:15, Joshua, is speaking to 
his own people the Israelites, when he says, “whether the gods which 
your fathers served on the other side of the flood, or the gods of the 
Amorites”. Joshua is saying this because he saw how these were the 
choices the Israelites were making! Because it was evil for them to 
serve the true and living God, they were choosing to serve other 
god’s! And that’s where we are now in regards to every nation of the 
world, which are about to become united in a one world order where 
Satan is seating in the seat of authority; not only over the corporate 
church, but the corporate world as well.  
 
          Be that as it may, for Joshua and his house, [Joshua typifying 
Christ who is the bridegroom of His bride the elect], they will serve 
the LORD, according to the scriptures. 
 
          A nation that has for the past seventy years thrown the word of 
God behind its back cannot be showing the possibility of God’s future 
blessing, but only His judgment and destruction as He has shown us 
throughout the Old Testament with National Israel:  
 
Matthew 24:32-33 ¶ Now learn a parable of the fig tree; When his 
branch is yet tender, and putteth forth leaves, ye know that summer 
is nigh:  33 So likewise ye, when ye shall see all these things, know 
that it is near, even at the doors. 
 
 


